

#	Name	Planned Duration	Start Date	Completion Date	%
1	GNSO Council Approves Issue Report	1 days	7/1/13 8:00 AM	7/1/13 5:00	100.
2	Complete Draft Issue Report	1 days	7/1/13 8:00 AM	7/1/13 5:00	100.
3	Initiate Public Comment Forum	1 days	7/1/13 8:00 AM	7/1/13 5:00	100.
4	Complete Final Issue Report	1 days	7/1/13 8:00 AM	7/1/13 5:00	100.
5	Submit Issue Report to GNSO Council for Consideration	1 days	7/1/13 8:00 AM	7/1/13 5:00	100.
6	Publish Call for Volunteers for Drafting WG Charter	1 days	7/1/13 8:00 AM	7/1/13 5:00	100.
7	<b>Support Charter Drafting Team</b>	43.88 days	10/16/13 8:00 AM	12/18/13	100.
8	Initial Charter Drafting Team Meeting	1 days	10/16/13 8:00 AM	10/16/13	100.
9	Charter Drafting Team Meeting	1 days	10/23/13 8:00 AM	10/23/13	100.
10	Charter Drafting Team Meeting	1 days	10/29/13 8:00 AM	10/29/13	100.
11	Charter Drafting Team Meeting	0.88 days	11/6/13 8:00 AM	11/6/13 5:00	100.
12	Charter Drafting Team Meeting in BA	0.88 days	11/14/13 8:00 AM	11/14/13	100.
13	Charter Drafting Team Meeting	0.88 days	12/4/13 8:00 AM	12/4/13 5:00	100.
14	Charter Drafting Team Meeting	0.88 days	12/11/13 8:00 AM	12/11/13	100.
15	Charter Drafting Team Meeting	0.88 days	12/18/13 8:00 AM	12/18/13	100.
16	Submit Charter to GNSO Council for Approval	0 days	1/13/14 8:00 AM	1/13/14 8:00	100. 7
17	Motions & documents due for GNSO Council Meeting 23 January	7 hrs	1/13/14 8:00 AM	1/13/14 5:00	100.
18	MetRep Charter Approved	0.88 days	1/23/14 8:00 AM	1/23/14 5:00	100. 16
19	Publish Call for Volunteers for Working Group	10 days	1/24/14 8:00 AM	2/6/14 6:00	100. 18
20	<b>Support Working Group - Initial Report</b>	23 days	3/5/14 8:00 AM	2/10/15 6:00	69.4
21	Working Group Meeting	0.88 days	3/5/14 8:00 AM	3/5/14 5:00	100. 19
22	Working Group Meeting	1 days	3/12/14 8:00 AM	3/12/14 5:00	100.
23	Working Group Meeting - Singapore Session	1 days	3/26/14 8:00 AM	3/26/14 5:00	100.
24	Working Group Meeting	1 days	4/9/14 8:00 AM	4/9/14 5:00	100.
25	Working Group Meeting	1 days	4/16/14 8:00 AM	4/16/14 5:00	100.
26	Working Group Meeting - Review of Fast Flux	1 days	5/6/14 8:00 AM	5/6/14 5:00	100.
27	Working Group Meeting - Review of PEDNR	1 days	5/20/14 8:00 AM	5/20/14 5:00	100.
28	Working Group Meeting - Review of Domain Tasting	1 days	6/3/14 8:00 AM	6/3/14 5:00	100.
29	Working Group Meeting - Review of IRTTP-A London Session	1 days	6/26/14 8:00 AM	6/26/14 5:00	100.
30	Working Group Meeting	1 days	7/2/14 8:00 AM	7/2/14 5:00	100.
31	Working Group Meeting	1 days	8/5/14 8:00 AM	8/5/14 5:00	100.
32	Working Group Meeting	1 days	8/19/14 8:00 AM	8/19/14 5:00	100.
33	Working Group Meeting	1 days	9/9/14 8:00 AM	9/9/14 5:00	100.
34	Working Group Meeting	1 days	9/23/14 8:00 AM	9/23/14 5:00	100.
35	Working Group Meeting - LA Session	1 days	10/13/14 8:00 AM	10/13/14	100.
36	Working Group Meeting	1 days	11/4/14 8:00 AM	11/4/14 6:00	100.
37	Working Group Meeting	1 days	11/18/14 8:00 AM	11/18/14	0.0
38	Working Group Meeting	1 days	12/2/14 8:00 AM	12/2/14 6:00	0.0
39	Working Group Meeting	1 days	12/16/14 8:00 AM	12/16/14	0.0
40	Working Group Meeting	1 days	1/6/15 8:00 AM	1/6/15 6:00	0.0
41	Working Group Meeting	1 days	1/20/15 8:00 AM	1/20/15 6:00	0.0
42	Working Group Meeting	1 days	2/3/15 8:00 AM	2/3/15 6:00	0.0
43	Working Group Meeting - Singapore	1 days	2/10/15 8:00 AM	2/10/15 6:00	0.0
44	Evaluate previous PDP and non-PDP Working Group efforts as use cases to explore where metrics and reporting	10 days	8/20/14 8:00 AM	9/3/14 5:00	100. 26.
45	Establish a baseline of current practices, capabilities & plans wr regard to problem-reporting, complaint-submission	10 days	9/4/14 8:00 AM	9/17/14 5:00	100. 44
46	Evaluate & Define framework for collaboration with Contracted Parties for Data & Metrics (Review DSSA Materials)	50 days	9/18/14 8:00 AM	11/26/14	90.0 45
47	Evaluate GNSO PDP documentation templates to determine how they may be enhanced to better inform PDP and	50 days	9/18/14 8:00 AM	11/26/14	70.0 45
48	Evaluate possible external DNS data sources that may benefit GNSO policy-making	30 days	12/1/14 9:00 AM	1/20/15 6:00	50.0 47
49	<b>Draft Initial Report</b>	26 days	1/21/15 9:00 AM	2/25/15 6:00	0.0
50	Create draft versions of DMPM Initial Report	10 days	1/21/15 9:00 AM	2/9/15 6:00	0.0 48
51	Co-ordinate staff input and review of WG recommendations	10 days	2/4/15 9:00 AM	2/17/15 6:00	0.0 50
52	WG Review of draft DMPM Initial Report	5 days	2/18/15 9:00 AM	2/24/15 6:00	0.0 51
53	Create final version of DMPM Initial Report	1 days	2/25/15 9:00 AM	2/25/15 6:00	0.0 52
54	Initiate Public Comment Forum	35 days	2/26/15 9:00 AM	4/15/15 5:00	0.0 49
55	<b>Support Working Group - DMPM Final Report</b>	9 days	4/16/15 8:00 AM	4/28/15 5:00	0.0
56	Working Group Meeting	1 days	4/16/15 8:00 AM	4/16/15 5:00	0.0 54
57	Working Group Meeting	1 days	4/28/15 8:00 AM	4/28/15 5:00	0.0
58	<b>Draft Final Report</b>	20 days	4/29/15 8:00 AM	5/26/15 5:00	0.0
59	Create draft version of DMPM Final Report	5 days	4/29/15 8:00 AM	5/5/15 5:00	0.0 55
60	Co-ordinate staff input and review of WG recommendations	5 days	5/6/15 8:00 AM	5/12/15 5:00	0.0 59
61	Create Final version of DMPM Final Report	5 days	5/13/15 8:00 AM	5/19/15 5:00	0.0 60
62	WG Review and last edits to Final Report	5 days	5/20/15 8:00 AM	5/26/15 5:00	0.0 61
63	Submit Final Report to GNSO Council for Approval	1 days	5/27/15 8:00 AM	5/27/15 5:00	0.0 58
64	Provide Final Report to GNSO for approval	1 days	5/28/15 8:00 AM	5/28/15 5:00	0.0 63
65	Prepare Board Paper	1 days	5/29/15 8:00 AM	5/29/15 5:00	0.0 64



